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Selected

Per UnitBid

S.No Generic Name Unit | Bidder Name Price (NPR)

1 | Bendamustin 100 MG Vial | Vision care International Pvt. Ltd.., 2,980,00

2 Bortezomib 2 mg Vial | Vision care International Pvt. Ltd.., 1,999.00

3.1 | Carboplatin inj 450 mg Vial | Vision care International Pvt. Ltd.., 2,367.00

3.2 | Carboplatin inj150 mg Vial | Vision care International Pvt. Ltd.., 980.00

4.1 | Cisplatin 10mg Vial | Vision care International Pvt, Ltd,., 104.00

4.2 | Cisplatin 50 mg Vial | Vision care International Pvt, Ltd.,, 400.00
5.1 | Cyclophosphamide 50mg | Tab | No Bid
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5.2 | Cyclophosphamide 1gm Vial | Vision care International Pvt, Ltd.., 140.00
5.3 | Cyclophosphamide 200mg | Vial | Vision care International Put, Ltd.,, 55.00
54 | Cyclophosphamide 500 mg | Vial | Vision care International Pvt. Ltd.., 80.00
6.1 | Cytarabine 1gm Vial | NoBid
6.2 | Cytarabine 100 mg Vial | No Bid
7.1 | Dacarbazine 200 mg Vial | Yetichem Distributos Pvt. Ltd, 355.00
7.2 | Dacarbazine 500 mg Vial | NO bid
8.1 | Docetaxel inj 20 mg Vial | Prime Life Care International Pvt, Ltd 1,345.00
8.2 | Docetaxel inj 80 mg Vial | Prime Life Care International Pvt. Ltd 4,170.00
9.1 | Doxorubicin 50 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 545.00
9.2 | Doxorubicin 10 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 165.00
Epirubicin Hydrochloride
10.1 | 10 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 220.00
Epirubicin Hydrochloride
10.2 | S0mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 550.00
11 | Erlotinib 150 mg Tab | Prime Life Care International Pvt. Ltd 237.00
12 | Etoposide 100 mg Vial | Vision care international Pvt. Ltd.., 200.00
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13 | Filgrastim inj 300 uG (1 ML} | PFS | DXM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 415.00
14.1 | Fluorouracil 500 mg Vial | No Bid
Amp/
14.2 | Fluorouracil 250 mg Vial | No8id
15 | Gefitinib 250 mg Tab | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 67.00
16 | Hydroxyurea 500 mg Cap | Yetichem Distributos Pvt, Ltd. 10.50
17 | Irinotecan inj 100 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt, Ltd 890.00
18 | Letrozole 2.5 mg Tab | Yetichem Distributos Pyt, Ltd. 12.30
Leucovorin Calcium inj 50
19 | mg Vial | Vision care International Pwt. Ltd.., 292.00
20 | Methotrexate 10 mg Tab | NoBid
21 | Methotrexate 5 mg Tab | NoBid
22 | Methotrexate 7.5 mg Tab | No Bid
Mitoxantrane 25 mg/12.5
23 | ml Vial | No Bid
24.1 | Oxaliplatin 50 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 770.00
24.2 | Oxaliplatin 100 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 1,324.00
25.1 | Paclitaxel 100 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 1,500.00
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25.2 | Paclitaxel 260 mg Vial | Estimate Crossed
25.3 | Paclitaxel 30 mg vial | No bid
26 | Pegfilgrastim inj 6 mg PES | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 2,950.00
27.1 | Pemetrexed 500 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt, Ltd 2,050.00
27.2 | Pemetrexed 100 mg Vial | DKM Pharmaceuticals Pvt. Ltd 1,050.00
28.1 | Rituximab 100 mg vial | Yetichem Distributos Pvt. Ltd. 4,800.00
28.2 | Rituximab 500 mg vial | Yetichem Distributos Pvt. Ltd. 20,800.00
29 | Sorafenib 200 mg Tab | Estimate Crossed
30 | Tamoxifen 10 mg Tab | Yetichem Distributos Pvt. Ltd. 3.50
31 | Tamoxifen 20 mg Tab | Yetichem Distributos Pvt. Ltd. 6.20
32 | Vinblastin 10 mg vial | NoBid
33 | Vincristine 1 mg Vial | Estimate Crossed
34 | Vinorelbine inj 10 mg Vial | APlus Medico
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